
Eagle Mountain-Saginaw I.S.D.

Virtual Welding Simulators

RFCSP No.  1213-001

RFCSP TABULATION

Item Description Proposed 
Brand

Proposed 
Model # Unit Price Extended 

Price
Proposed 

Brand
Proposed 
Model # Unit Price Extended 

Price

1 2 ea
Virtual Reality GMAW, SMAW, and 
FCAW
Welding Simulator

LINCOLN
AD1332-1 

and AD1390-
2

49,500.00 99,000.00 Lincoln Vrtex 360 49,000.00 98,000.00

1a 2 ea ExtensionsTM Upgrade 2 LINCOLN AD1390-2 4,000.00 8,000.00 LINCOLN AD1390-2 4,000.00 8,000.00

1b 2 ea Shipping Costs, if any 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

TOTAL ITEM 1 107,000.00 106,000.00

2 10 ea Virtual Reality GMAW (MIG) Welder No Bid No Bid

NO BIDS: 
Midwest Technology Products

Qty/Unit

DELIVERY: 28-56 Days 8-10 Weeks
EPCNT: Yes Yes
DEVIATIONS: Yes Yes
TERMS: Net Net
COMPANY NAME: Ferguson Industrial Gases Matheson Gas

September 4, 2012
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Eagle Mountain-Saginaw I.S.D.

Virtual Welding Simulators

RFCSP No.  1213-001

RFCSP TABULATION

Item Description

1 2 ea
Virtual Reality GMAW, SMAW, and 
FCAW
Welding Simulator

1a 2 ea ExtensionsTM Upgrade 2

1b 2 ea Shipping Costs, if any

TOTAL ITEM 1

2 10 ea Virtual Reality GMAW (MIG) Welder

NO BIDS: 
Midwest Technology Products

Qty/Unit

DELIVERY:
EPCNT: 
DEVIATIONS:
TERMS:
COMPANY NAME:

September 4, 2012

Proposed 
Brand

Proposed 
Model # Unit Price Extended 

Price
Proposed 

Brand
Proposed 
Model # Unit Price Extended 

Price

VRTEX 360
AD 1332-1 

and AD1332-
2

73,500.00 147,000.00 Lincoln AD 1332-1 48,461.54 96,923.08

LINCOLN AD1390-2 4,000.00 8,000.00 LINCOLN AD1390-2 3,956.00 7,912.00

0.00 0.00 500.00 1,000.00

155,000.00 105,835.08

No Bid No Bid

 

4-8 Weeks 8-10 Weeks
Yes Yes
No Yes
Net Net
Metroplex Service Welding Supply Red Ball Oxygen

Virtual Welding Simulators EMS ISD RFCSP 1213-001 2 of 3



Eagle Mountain-Saginaw I.S.D.

Virtual Welding Simulators

RFCSP No.  1213-001

RFCSP TABULATION

Item Description

1 2 ea
Virtual Reality GMAW, SMAW, and 
FCAW
Welding Simulator

1a 2 ea ExtensionsTM Upgrade 2

1b 2 ea Shipping Costs, if any

TOTAL ITEM 1

2 10 ea Virtual Reality GMAW (MIG) Welder

NO BIDS: 
Midwest Technology Products

Qty/Unit

DELIVERY:
EPCNT: 
DEVIATIONS:
TERMS:
COMPANY NAME:

September 4, 2012

Proposed 
Brand

Proposed 
Model # Unit Price Extended 

Price

No Bid

No Bid

TEACHW
ELD 4,476.00 44,760.00

14 Days
Yes
No
Net
Realityworks
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